

VILLAGE OF HIGHLAND FALLS - 2022-2023 CHEMICAL BIDS

Bid Opening: Dat 27 May-22

No. bids.

	COYNE	JONES (JCI)	SLACK	Kuehne	
A SODA ASH - 58%	0.5105 /lb	no Bid /lb	0.347 /lb	/lb	/lb
B POLYALUMINUMHYDROXYCLOROSULFATE / CES PACLL 950S	8.6078 /gal	no Bid /gal	no Bid /gal	/gal	/gal
C HYDROFLOR. ACID 25%	9.9925 /gal	no Bid /gal	8.139 /gal	/gal	/gal
D CHLORINE (GAS) - 150 lb containers CHLORINE (GAS) - 2000 lb containers	N.B. /lb N.B. /ton	no Bid /lb \$3.300 ⁰⁰ /ton 575	3.89 /lb no Bid /ton	/lb /ton	/lb /ton
E CHLORINE (LIQUID) - 5 gal containers CHLORINE (LIQUID) - 15 gal containers	N.B. /gal N.B. /gal	no Bid /gal no Bid /gal	7.99 /gal 5.99 /gal	/gal /gal	/gal /gal
F SODIUM BICARBONATE	0.5441 /lb	no Bid /lb	0.457 /lb	/lb	/lb
G LIME	0.8636 /lb	no Bid /lb	0.548 /lb	/lb	/lb
H SODIUM HYDROXIDE (CAUSTIC SODA) - 50%	N.B. /gal	4.72 /gal	5.94 /gal	/gal	/gal
I SODIUM HYDROXIDE (CAUSTIC SODA) - 25%	N.B. /gal	2.10 /gal	2.99 /gal	/gal	/gal

N.B = No Bid

10:00 am - John Jones Village of Highland Falls
REGINA TAYLOR